
[[X48984]] VOLVO A25G 752510 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP439912
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: X48984

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lake CharlesPO BOX 16955LAKE CHARLES, LAUS  70616Contact: SAMANTHA SOILEAUssoileau@scottcompanies.comT: (337)433-9811F: (318)433-6623
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6244Unique No: 11033028Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 17 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 06181702 (Generated: 05/17/2024 15:36:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SAMANTHA SOILEAU - VOLVO6244

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439912 --- --- ---Sample Date 10 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2407 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 85.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.170 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 274 --- --- ---Copper ppm 52 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 10 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 5 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 923 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 404 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1477 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 226 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6244 [WUSCAR] 06181702 (Generated: 05/17/2024 15:36:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SAMANTHA SOILEAU - VOLVO6244
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752510\Front Left Final Drive [VCP439912] 10 May 2024 @ 2407.0 hrs

