
[[34236 BIG SKY DAIRY]] VOLVO L70H 625117 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP453982
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILFLUID 424
Job No: 34236 BIG SKY DAIRY

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY464 WASHINGTON STREET STWIN FALLS, IDUS  83301Contact: JANAE HYMASjhymas@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)733-1715F: (775)356-7152
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Oiland filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. The oil is no longerserviceable due to the presence ofcontaminants.

Depot: VOLVO1835Unique No: 11033046Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 20 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06181720 (Generated: 05/20/2024 11:05:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453982 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2861 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 190 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 189 --- --- ---Copper ppm 58 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 34 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3488 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 22 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1429 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1297 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 130 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO1835 [WUSCAR] 06181720 (Generated: 05/20/2024 11:05:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JANAE HYMAS - VOLVO1835
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 625117\Rear Axle [VCP453982] 06 May 2024 @ 2861.0 hrs

