
[[A12526]] VOLVO L70H 624758 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP449561
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A12526

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or bushingwear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 11033073Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 20 May 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06181747 (Generated: 05/20/2024 11:27:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449561 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1055 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1055 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 25 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 132 --- --- ---Copper ppm 582 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm 56 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3934 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1625 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1533 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 143 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06181747 (Generated: 05/20/2024 11:27:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624758\Rear Axle [VCP449561] 29 Apr 2024 @ 1055.0 hrs

