
[[A12526]] VOLVO L70H 624758 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP449574
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A12526

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Viscosityof sample indicates oil is within ISO32 range, advise investigate. Confirmoil type.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 11033140Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 May 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06181814 (Generated: 05/23/2024 12:34:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449574 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1055 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1055 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 32.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 129 --- --- ---Copper ppm 10 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 8 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 89 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 50 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 211 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 65 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06181814 (Generated: 05/23/2024 12:34:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624758\Transmission (Auto) [VCP449574] 29 Apr 2024 @ 1055.0 hrs

