
VOLVO L120H 633400 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP436488
Oil Type: VALVOLINE 15W40
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: TAVINS BANKStavins@citycart.netT: (203)223-3885F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 11033698Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 20 May 2024
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06182372 (Generated: 05/20/2024 13:54:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436488 VCP438997 VCP437215 VCP437221Sample Date 08 May 2024 12 Apr 2024 20 Mar 2024 20 Feb 2024Machine Hours 2798 0 2323 2033Oil Hours 0 0 290 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION MARGINAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 11.3 12.4 11.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.6 7.0 7.1 6.0Oxidation (PA) % 35 43 37 44
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 51 54 55 58Sulfation (PA) % 43 46 45 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.3Silicon ppm 11 8 7 11Sodium ppm 3 1 0 1Potassium ppm 4 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 5 7 11Copper ppm 3 <1 2 12Lead ppm 2 0 0 0Tin ppm 3 1 0 1Aluminum ppm 6 3 3 6Chromium ppm 3 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 55 79 22 25Nickel ppm 3 0 0 0Titanium ppm 2 0 0 0Silver ppm 3 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 0 0 <1Vanadium ppm 2 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1859 1799 2135 1769Magnesium ppm 185 260 198 120Zinc ppm 956 981 1037 844Phosphorus ppm 815 819 899 753Barium ppm 2 0 0 <1Boron ppm 40 77 17 9

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06182372 (Generated: 05/20/2024 13:54:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAVINS BANKS - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 633400\Diesel Engine [VCP436488] 08 May 2024 @ 2798.0 hrs

