
VOLVO L150H 6989 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP436464
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: JOHN LINARESjlinares@win-waste.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component if applicable.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. High concentration ofvisible dirt/debris present in the oil.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 11034540Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 21 May 2024
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06183214 (Generated: 05/21/2024 13:23:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN LINARES - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436464 VCP432600 VCP411573 ---Sample Date 09 May 2024 22 Feb 2024 02 Oct 2023 ---Machine Hours 7072 6479 5387 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 44.2 55.8 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 14 13 19 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 4 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 2 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 43 93 120 ---Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 <1 0 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm <1 1 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 1 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 3 4 ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 2 3 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3977 3728 3987 ---Magnesium ppm 0 20 12 ---Zinc ppm 1597 1578 1609 ---Phosphorus ppm 1311 1304 1435 ---Barium ppm 0 0 1 ---Boron ppm 138 125 151 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 06183214 (Generated: 05/21/2024 13:23:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN LINARES - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L150H 6989\Rear Axle [VCP436464] 09 May 2024 @ 7072.0 hrs

