
VOLVO A45G 352916 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450926
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 11035292Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 21 May 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06183966 (Generated: 05/21/2024 14:55:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450926 VCP431068 VCP432938 VCP418153Sample Date 08 May 2024 26 Jan 2024 11 Oct 2023 25 Jul 2023Machine Hours 4510 4034 3517 3005Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 12.8 12.8 12.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.6 9.8 10.1 9.8Oxidation (PA) % 76 77 79 76
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.4 0.6 0.5 0.4Nitration (PA) % 61 62 59 57Sulfation (PA) % 59 60 62 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 6 7 6Sodium ppm <1 2 2 3Potassium ppm 2 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 11 9 9Copper ppm 2 1 2 6Lead ppm <1 1 0 0Tin ppm 2 1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 3 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 44 40 39 48Nickel ppm 2 5 1 1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1692 1571 1581 1804Magnesium ppm 499 518 432 530Zinc ppm 1119 1129 922 1002Phosphorus ppm 970 973 783 832Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 53 38 33 40

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06183966 (Generated: 05/21/2024 14:55:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352916\Diesel Engine [VCP450926] 08 May 2024 @ 4510.0 hrs

