
[[702905 APTIM]] VOLVO A35G 340070 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437500
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 702905 APTIM

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 11036742Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 23 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06185416 (Generated: 05/23/2024 07:13:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437500 VCP454421 VCP436217 VCP422957Sample Date 29 Apr 2024 12 Jan 2024 26 Oct 2023 26 Jun 2023Machine Hours 9862 9239 8853 8469Oil Hours 500 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 12.0 12.0 12.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.5 9.3 9.7 9.8Oxidation (PA) % 69 64 77 78
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.4 0.1 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 75 60 58 63Sulfation (PA) % 59 53 59 59Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 5 5 4Sodium ppm 13 <1 2 2Potassium ppm 6 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 5 5 5Copper ppm 2 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 7 2 2 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 77 51 43 41Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1605 1343 1601 1629Magnesium ppm 1202 843 491 490Zinc ppm 1662 1249 1105 1079Phosphorus ppm 1497 1022 910 884Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 9 13 33 28

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06185416 (Generated: 05/23/2024 07:13:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 340070\Diesel Engine [VCP437500] 29 Apr 2024 @ 9862.0 hrs

