
[[X48143]] KOBELCO SK350LC-10 605072 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP450948
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X48143

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 11042531Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 24 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06185779 (Generated: 05/24/2024 14:44:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450948 VCP371272 VCP371162 VCP371084Sample Date 17 May 2024 18 Jan 2023 04 Jan 2023 19 Dec 2022Machine Hours 4381 0 3657 3656Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status MARGINAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.9 13.1 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.4 11.1 11 12.2Oxidation (PA) % 85 81 80 86
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 63 49 48 52Sulfation (PA) % 62 61 61 66Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 2.3 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 8 6 5Sodium ppm 3 0 4 0Potassium ppm <1 0 1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 0 4 4Copper ppm 3 2 1 1Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm 40 39 42 44Nickel ppm 0 0 2 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 1Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1670 1594 1694 1759Magnesium ppm 508 478 497 479Zinc ppm 1113 998 1114 1093Phosphorus ppm 952 846 916 922Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 54 70 70 66

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06185779 (Generated: 05/24/2024 14:44:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOBELCO KOBELCO SK350LC-10 605072\Diesel Engine [VCP450948] 17 May 2024 @ 4381.0 hrs

