
[[W0230588]] VOLVO A40G 752092 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429422
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: W0230588

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: ROB HOLCOMBrholcomb@romco.comT: (817)798-9289F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. Elementallevel of silicon (Si) above normalindicating ingress of dirt/sealmaterial. The oil viscosity is lowerthan normal. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 11042541Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06185789 (Generated: 05/24/2024 18:43:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB HOLCOMB - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429422 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 735 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 10.4 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 5.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 56 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 77 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.4 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 26 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 --- --- ---Copper ppm 162 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 80 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2367 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1199 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 989 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 62 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06185789 (Generated: 05/24/2024 18:43:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB HOLCOMB - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 752092\Diesel Engine [VCP429422] 15 May 2024 @ .0 hrs

