
[[SW-34384-2 CHAISON]] VOLVO ECR88D 216060 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP369535
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SW-34384-2 CHAISON

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 11043296Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06186544 (Generated: 05/23/2024 13:49:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP369535 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2963 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 182 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 57 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 117 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 10 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2673 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 814 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 835 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06186544 (Generated: 05/23/2024 13:49:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR88D 216060\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP369535] 15 May 2024 @ 2963.0 hrs

