
[[X48143]] KOBELCO SK350LC-10 605072 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP450952
Oil Type: KOBELCO
Job No: X48143

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: ANDY CHAMBERSachambers@scottcompanies.comT: F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 11043379Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 29 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06186627 (Generated: 05/29/2024 15:42:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP450952 VCP371277 VCP371158 ---Sample Date 17 May 2024 18 Jan 2023 04 Jan 2023 ---Machine Hours 4381 0 3657 ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.10 8.25 8.20 ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 600 448 560 ---Percentage Glycol % 48.7 48.6 48.6 ---Freezing Point °C -31 -31 -31 ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal normal normal ---Coolant Color Blue Blue Green ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06186627 (Generated: 05/29/2024 15:42:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ANDY CHAMBERS - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOBELCO KOBELCO SK350LC-10 605072\Coolant [VCP450952] 17 May 2024 @ 4381.0 hrs

