
[[SWO-072114 APAC]] VOLVO EC480E 314549 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454598
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SWO-072114 APAC

COWIN EQUIPMENT COMPANY INC1501 HWY 78 EASTOXFORD, ALUS  36203Contact: MIKE PATTYmpatty@cowin.comT: (256)832-5053F: (256)831-4295
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: COWOXFUnique No: 11047537Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 May 2024
Report Id: COWOXF [WUSCAR] 06190785 (Generated: 05/28/2024 07:52:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE PATTY - COWOXF

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454598 VCP435545 --- ---Sample Date 22 May 2024 08 Dec 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 4555 4060 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 271 265 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 11 11 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 469 985 --- ---Copper ppm <1 1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 4 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 8 2 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 5 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 127 107 --- ---Magnesium ppm 47 22 --- ---Zinc ppm 117 77 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 919 893 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 126 97 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: COWOXF [WUSCAR] 06190785 (Generated: 05/28/2024 07:52:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE PATTY - COWOXF
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 314549\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP454598] 22 May 2024 @ 4555.0 hrs

