
[[5592DR NEW ENTERPRIS]] VOLVO EC480EL 311235 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP428642
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 5592DR NEW ENTERPRIS

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT & SUPPLY COPO BOX 127DRUMS, PAUS  18222Contact: JOSEPH GLOWACKIjoe@hwyequip.comT: (570)788-1127F: (570)708-2933
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0022Unique No: 11047544Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 29 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0022 [WUSCAR] 06190792 (Generated: 05/29/2024 13:28:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOSEPH GLOWACKI - VOLVO0022

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP428642 VCP298681 VCP263973 ---Sample Date 21 May 2024 05 Apr 2021 12 Dec 2019 ---Machine Hours 2809 1150 486 ---Oil Hours 1000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 141 188 160 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Silicon ppm 29 13 17 ---Sodium ppm 2 2 2 ---Potassium ppm 4 2 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 295 311 377 ---Copper ppm <1 2 <1 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 6 3 2 ---Chromium ppm 4 4 5 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 1 0 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 0 ---Manganese ppm 3 4 5 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 48 79 13 ---Magnesium ppm 10 19 2 ---Zinc ppm 31 72 22 ---Phosphorus ppm 614 676 322 ---Barium ppm 0 <1 4 ---Boron ppm 57 80 1 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0022 [WUSCAR] 06190792 (Generated: 05/29/2024 13:28:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOSEPH GLOWACKI - VOLVO0022
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 311235\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP428642] 21 May 2024 @ 2809.0 hrs

