
[[SWA560078-10]] VOLVO L180H 5412 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP430324
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: SWA560078-10

CALLANANRT 32 677 FLATBUSH RDEAST KINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: 
T: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: CALEASUnique No: 11048082Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 29 May 2024
Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 06191330 (Generated: 05/29/2024 15:52:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP430324 VCP442818 VCP396098 VCP303365Sample Date 16 May 2024 07 Feb 2024 01 Feb 2023 18 Jun 2022Machine Hours 9182 7046 6657 4250Oil Hours 500 0 2000 0Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.6 26.3 27.1 27.3
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4 5 5 5Sodium ppm 2 3 3 5Potassium ppm 0 0 2 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 86 38 37Copper ppm 3 7 6 4Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 2 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 78 51 95 81Magnesium ppm <1 1 2 0Zinc ppm 4 13 11 9Phosphorus ppm 213 180 197 182Barium ppm <1 <1 0 0Boron ppm 103 82 74 54

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CALEAS [WUSCAR] 06191330 (Generated: 05/29/2024 15:52:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ? ? - CALEAS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180H 5412\Transmission (Auto) [VCP430324] 16 May 2024 @ 9182.0 hrs

