
[[SWA562564 SRM]]  - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP454136
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)
Job No: SWA562564 SRM

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JUSTIN TIMBERLAKEJUSTIN.TIMBERLAKE@ALTG.COMT: F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component.All metal levelsare normal indicating no corrosion inthe system. Moderate concentrationof visible dirt/debris present in thefuel. The water content is negligible.The condition of the fuel isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 11048505Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 03 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06191753 (Generated: 06/03/2024 13:53:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN TIMBERLAKE - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454136 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 8986 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 67 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.59 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.005 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06191753 (Generated: 06/03/2024 13:53:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUSTIN TIMBERLAKE - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO \Diesel Fuel [VCP454136] 15 May 2024 @ 8986.0 hrs

