
[[A12583]] VOLVO ECR235D 210265 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP436573
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A12583

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.Cylinder, crank, or camshaft wear is indicated. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 11048556Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 06191804 (Generated: 05/30/2024 11:45:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP436573 VCP408932 VCP341004 VCBM001650Sample Date 16 May 2024 27 Jun 2023 08 Nov 2021 01 Apr 2021Machine Hours 7756 7470 6940 6720Oil Hours 250 250 250 50Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 12.8 12.35 12.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.4 11.2 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 49 81 76 71
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 66 63 55 43Sulfation (PA) % 47 61 60 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.4Silicon ppm 12 12 10 8Sodium ppm 2 4 4 2Potassium ppm 3 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 111 137 49 23Copper ppm 3 2 1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm 2 1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 8 7 6 2Chromium ppm 2 2 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 30 41 49 51Nickel ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm 2 4 <1 <1Silver ppm 1 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1863 1775 1712 1651Magnesium ppm 380 537 520 409Zinc ppm 1135 1124 1025 1044Phosphorus ppm 926 943 943 857Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 12 53 52 72

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 06191804 (Generated: 05/30/2024 11:45:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235D 210265\Diesel Engine [VCP436573] 16 May 2024 @ 7756.0 hrs

