
[[703480 IHFT]] SENNEBOGEN 830 1590 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP453662
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 703480 IHFT

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light concentration of carbon/sootpresent in the oil. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 11048565Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 29 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06191813 (Generated: 05/29/2024 09:33:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453662 VCP442759 VCP426604 VCP380839Sample Date 23 May 2024 21 Nov 2023 28 Mar 2023 04 Jan 2023Machine Hours 15473 14126 12416 11870Oil Hours 500 900 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed N/ASample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 15.6 15.1 14.0 14.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.2 7.2 8.6 8.9Oxidation (PA) % 83 68 60 65
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 3.3 2.3 1.3 1.8Nitration (PA) % 111 92 75 79Sulfation (PA) % 76 65 60 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 5 5 3Sodium ppm 2 2 1 <1Potassium ppm 3 1 <1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 31 23 19 22Copper ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 4 3 2 2Chromium ppm 2 1 1 1Molybdenum ppm 85 76 74 66Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1795 1727 1760 1274Magnesium ppm 622 476 771 832Zinc ppm 1370 1266 1414 1254Phosphorus ppm 1078 1018 1139 1025Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 26 37 22 9

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06191813 (Generated: 05/29/2024 09:33:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830 1590\Diesel Engine [VCP453662] 23 May 2024 @ 15473.0 hrs

