
[TMR-OKEECHOBEE [716012]] 434166 VOLVO L180H 4821 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP449963
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 716012

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - OKEECHOBEE9800 NE 128TH AVEOKEECHOBEE, FLUS  34972Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: (863)467-9810F: (863)467-9814
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal.Confirm oil type. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: TRAOKEUnique No: 11048864Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06192112 (Generated: 05/30/2024 16:45:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP449963 VCP445666 VCP435343 VCP408044Sample Date 18 May 2024 12 Feb 2024 23 Jan 2024 01 May 2023Machine Hours 16357 15531 15313 13007Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 62.3 61.7 59.54 49.7Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.81 --- 0.597 0.35
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 50057 34407 8292 4533Particles >6µm 12620 5003 1067 731Particles >14µm 691 130 20 22ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/21/17 22/20/14 20/17/11 19/17/12Silicon ppm <1 <1 <1 1Sodium ppm <1 1 1 5Potassium ppm <1 0 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 1 1 1Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 0Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 0 0 0Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm <1 2 2 4Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 116 93 112 91Magnesium ppm 14 11 16 24Zinc ppm 427 409 406 470Phosphorus ppm 358 348 375 380Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 2 3 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOKE [WUSCAR] 06192112 (Generated: 05/30/2024 16:45:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOKE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 434166 VOLVO L180H 4821\Hydraulic System [VCP449963] 18 May 2024 @ 16357.0 hrs

