
[[A12681]] VOLVO ECR235CL 110022 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP454453
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A12681

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. Additive levels indicatethe addition of a different brand, ortype of oil. Confirm oil type. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 11048875Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06192123 (Generated: 05/30/2024 14:29:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454453 VCP363934 VCP339385 VCP229018Sample Date 16 May 2024 26 Aug 2022 07 Dec 2021 23 Jul 2018Machine Hours 10505 9785 9125 6740Oil Hours 500 2000 1500 500Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.4 44.0 39.7 38.8Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 1.04 0.77 0.558 0.507
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 22045 106816 14557 17521Particles >6µm 4254 6033 3715 3536Particles >14µm 248 14 242 207ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/19/15 24/20/11 21/19/15 21/19/15Silicon ppm 9 15 5 4Sodium ppm 2 5 2 2Potassium ppm 0 0 1 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 16 12 7Copper ppm 4 9 13 8Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 3 2 1Chromium ppm 2 6 10 10Molybdenum ppm 2 7 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1910 1938 459 492Magnesium ppm 32 41 9 11Zinc ppm 1053 992 644 636Phosphorus ppm 851 808 499 493Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 73 80 3 9

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06192123 (Generated: 05/30/2024 14:29:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235CL 110022\Hydraulic System [VCP454453] 16 May 2024 @ 10505.0 hrs

