
[[703489 IHFT]] SENNEBOGEN 830R 2296 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454549
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 703489 IHFT

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL ELZERMANpaul.elzerman@altaequipment.comT: (248)356-5200F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level has decreased, but is stillabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 11049299Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06192547 (Generated: 05/30/2024 16:18:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454549 VCP431176 VCP399394 ---Sample Date 24 May 2024 05 Dec 2023 09 Feb 2023 ---Machine Hours 3753 2444 619 ---Oil Hours 1000 1000 2000 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 149 208 153 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.318 2.24 0.289 ---Silicon ppm 89 877 206 ---Sodium ppm 3 27 6 ---Potassium ppm 5 44 11 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 380 3644 1384 ---Copper ppm 85 193 63 ---Lead ppm 6 35 10 ---Tin ppm 2 13 1 ---Aluminum ppm 19 196 48 ---Chromium ppm 3 28 10 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 2 <1 ---Nickel ppm <1 3 <1 ---Titanium ppm 2 15 4 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 6 45 14 ---Vanadium ppm <1 1 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 230 1392 313 ---Magnesium ppm 36 316 63 ---Zinc ppm 54 53 19 ---Phosphorus ppm 1107 517 1735 ---Barium ppm 0 2 <1 ---Boron ppm 37 59 131 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06192547 (Generated: 05/30/2024 16:18:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL ELZERMAN - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 830R 2296\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP454549] 24 May 2024 @ 3753.0 hrs

