
VOLVO A30G 742023 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP447044
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 11049396Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Jun 2024
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06192644 (Generated: 06/04/2024 01:33:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447044 VCP414673 VCP415942 VCP394459Sample Date 01 Apr 2024 11 Sep 2023 14 Jun 2023 08 Mar 2023Machine Hours 8289 8246 7442 7220Oil Hours 0 2000 0 1500Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.66 28.1 28.5 28.4
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 4 3 6Sodium ppm <1 2 3 4Potassium ppm 1 1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 20 18 17Copper ppm 2 9 6 10Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 2 <1 1Aluminum ppm 3 6 11 10Chromium ppm <1 0 0 0Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 0 <1Nickel ppm <1 1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 72 69 66 71Magnesium ppm 2 2 0 <1Zinc ppm 13 6 0 5Phosphorus ppm 188 183 191 190Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 92 83 89 85

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06192644 (Generated: 06/04/2024 01:33:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742023\Transmission (Auto) [VCP447044] 01 Apr 2024 @ 8289.0 hrs

