
VOLVO L60H 622310 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP444390
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAjohn.fardella@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid and perform a filter service onthis component if not already done.We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is severe.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thefluid is no longer serviceable as aresult of the abnormal and/or severewear.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 11049397Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06192645 (Generated: 05/30/2024 16:44:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444390 VCP433306 --- ---Sample Date 24 May 2024 03 Jan 2024 --- ---Machine Hours 7951 7628 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd --- ---Sample Status SEVERE SEVERE --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.0 27.5 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 8 12 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 9 --- ---Potassium ppm 3 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 302 424 --- ---Copper ppm 11 16 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 7 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 3 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 2 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 7 11 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 74 65 --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 73 43 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 179 203 --- ---Barium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Boron ppm 57 43 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06192645 (Generated: 05/30/2024 16:44:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L60H 622310\Transmission (Auto) [VCP444390] 24 May 2024 @ 7951.0 hrs

