
[[42198]] VOLVO L110H 631798 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP447503
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 42198

215 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - CAYCE2303 AIRPORT BLVDCAYCE, SCUS  29033Contact: TAMI BROWDERtami.browder@ascendummachinery.comT: (803)923-2138F: (803)791-9920
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.The aluminum level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0013Unique No: 11050476Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 06193724 (Generated: 05/30/2024 22:06:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAMI BROWDER - VOLVO0013

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447503 VCP244427 VCP255910 VCP254781Sample Date 24 May 2024 23 Jan 2020 23 Oct 2019 16 Sep 2019Machine Hours 4126 0 1108 738Oil Hours 0 1719 0 0Oil Changed Changed N/A N/A N/ASample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.6 13.6 13.7 13.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 86 60 65 65
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.6 0.3 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 68 63 60 49Sulfation (PA) % 65 54 56 56Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 7 6 7 13Sodium ppm 4 5 3 3Potassium ppm 4 5 2 9
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 27 11 9 10Copper ppm 2 5 5 5Lead ppm 2 3 1 1Tin ppm 2 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 26 6 8 16Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 41 20 22 23Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm 1 2 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1680 1754 1637 1479Magnesium ppm 518 738 672 637Zinc ppm 1110 875 909 787Phosphorus ppm 955 693 724 739Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 51 66 60 52

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0013 [WUSCAR] 06193724 (Generated: 05/30/2024 22:06:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TAMI BROWDER - VOLVO0013
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L110H 631798\Diesel Engine [VCP447503] 24 May 2024 @ 4126.0 hrs

