
[[G08826]] VOLVO A40D 70043 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP439204
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: G08826

BLENHEIM CONSTRUCTION302 INDEPENDENCE BLVDSICKLERVILLE, NJUS  08081Contact: KEN LARDIklardi@blenheimconstruction.comT: (856)728-8880F: (856)728-8866
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. The systemcleanliness is acceptable for yourtarget ISO 4406 cleanliness code. Thesystem and fluid cleanliness isacceptable. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: BLECAMUnique No: 11056038Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: BLECAM [WUSCAR] 06193915 (Generated: 05/30/2024 15:41:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEN LARDI - BLECAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439204 VCP177195 VCP166599 VCP142397Sample Date 22 May 2024 26 Feb 2016 16 Mar 2015 11 Nov 2013Machine Hours 15722 8568 7459 6393Oil Hours 0 2000 1250 2000Oil Changed N/A Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 45.3 44.98 45.28 51.8Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.94 1.85 1.52 1.16
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 29504 280 162 1540Particles >6µm 316 152 88 838Particles >14µm 17 26 15 142ISO 4406:1999 (c) 22/15/11 15/14/12 15/14/11 18/17/14Silicon ppm 12 9 9 9Sodium ppm 4 3 2 2Potassium ppm 2 <1 1 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 6 4 4Copper ppm 11 19 13 16Lead ppm 1 1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 5 1 1 1Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2912 1878 1938 1699Magnesium ppm 137 151 160 43Zinc ppm 1346 1127 1068 919Phosphorus ppm 1136 896 877 812Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 94 55 52 50

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLECAM [WUSCAR] 06193915 (Generated: 05/30/2024 15:41:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEN LARDI - BLECAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 70043\Hydraulic System [VCP439204] 22 May 2024 @ 15722.0 hrs

