
[[X48266]] KUBOTA SVL97-2 F77105 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP454736
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: X48266

C & D LANDFILL3516 CENTRAL PIKEHERMITAGE, TXUS  37076Contact: KELLI PHILLIPSkdphillips@wcnx.orgT: (615)708-0563F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. Pleasespecify the brand, type, and viscosityof the oil on your next sample.Gearwear is indicated. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CDLHERUnique No: 11056541Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 31 May 2024
Report Id: CDLHER [WUSCAR] 06194418 (Generated: 05/31/2024 16:04:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KELLI PHILLIPS - CDLHER

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454736 --- --- ---Sample Date 21 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1280 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 164 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 505 --- --- ---Copper ppm 0 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 8 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 11 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 10 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 43 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 332 --- --- ---Barium ppm 21 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CDLHER [WUSCAR] 06194418 (Generated: 05/31/2024 16:04:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KELLI PHILLIPS - CDLHER
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KUBOTA KUBOTA SVL97-2 F77105\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP454736] 21 May 2024 @ 1280.0 hrs

