
[[G08814]] VOLVO EC300 316568 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP453656
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: G08814

WHIBCO INC377 PORT CUMBERLAND ROAD   DRAWER EPORT ELIZABETH, NJUS  08348Contact: JOHN HUGHESjhughes@whibco.comT: (856)305-6602F: (856)825-4743
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: WHIBRIUnique No: 11056543Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 31 May 2024
Report Id: WHIBRI [WUSCAR] 06194420 (Generated: 05/31/2024 16:06:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HUGHES - WHIBRI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453656 --- --- ---Sample Date 22 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 296 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 178 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 139 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 3 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 366 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WHIBRI [WUSCAR] 06194420 (Generated: 05/31/2024 16:06:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HUGHES - WHIBRI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300 316568\Swing Drive [VCP453656] 22 May 2024 @ 296.0 hrs

