
VOLVO EC350E 310403 - LEFT TRAVEL

Sample No: ML0001961
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No:

WILLIAM HAZELPO BOX 600CHANTILLY, VAUS  20153Contact: SERVICE MANAGERjimmy_elswick@wahazel.comT: (703)378-8300F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. We recommend thatyou drain the oil from the componentif this has not already been done. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. There is amoderate concentration of waterpresent in the oil. The oil viscosity ishigher than normal. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: WILCHAUnique No: 11056566Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 31 May 2024
Report Id: WILCHA [WUSCAR] 06194443 (Generated: 06/13/2024 10:06:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service - SERVICE MANAGER ? - WILCHA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number ML0001961 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9621 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 684 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.533 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 5480 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 178 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 393 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11671 --- --- ---Copper ppm 26 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1342 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 101 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 15 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 9 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 151 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 78 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 4 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 253 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 183 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 32 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 715 --- --- ---Barium ppm 9 --- --- ---Boron ppm 106 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WILCHA [WUSCAR] 06194443 (Generated: 06/13/2024 10:06:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service - SERVICE MANAGER ? - WILCHA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 310403\Left Travel [ML0001961] 23 May 2024 @ 9621.0 hrs

