
[[G08826]] VOLVO A40D 70043 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP453764
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: G08826

BLENHEIM CONSTRUCTION302 INDEPENDENCE BLVDSICKLERVILLE, NJUS  08081Contact: KEN LARDIklardi@blenheimconstruction.comT: (856)728-8880F: (856)728-8866
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: BLECAMUnique No: 11056609Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: BLECAM [WUSCAR] 06194486 (Generated: 05/30/2024 17:30:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEN LARDI - BLECAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP453764 VCP383595 VCP238751 VCP232589Sample Date 22 May 2024 02 Nov 2022 17 Jul 2019 29 Jan 2019Machine Hours 15722 14041 0 11200Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A N/A N/A Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.8 28.15 31.6 28.98
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2 3 3 3Sodium ppm 5 6 11 10Potassium ppm 2 <1 8 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 37 28 26Copper ppm 201 344 275 198Lead ppm 3 3 2 1Tin ppm 10 17 13 10Aluminum ppm 8 9 5 4Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 3 7 6Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 122 202 521 536Magnesium ppm 15 51 110 117Zinc ppm 35 101 216 222Phosphorus ppm 209 212 328 329Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 89 71 75 79

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: BLECAM [WUSCAR] 06194486 (Generated: 05/30/2024 17:30:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KEN LARDI - BLECAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 70043\Transmission (Auto) [VCP453764] 22 May 2024 @ 15722.0 hrs

