
[[HERC RENTALS]] VOLVO A30G 753512 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP454999
Oil Type: DEXRON III
Job No: HERC RENTALS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is (GENERIC)DEXRON III.  Please confirm. All component wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 11056618Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 May 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06194495 (Generated: 05/30/2024 17:30:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454999 VCP436184 --- ---Sample Date 22 May 2024 14 Oct 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1885 702 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.2 28.6 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 0.083 --- ---Silicon ppm 15 12 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 3 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 41 24 --- ---Copper ppm 26 18 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 6 3 --- ---Aluminum ppm 31 14 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 2 2 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm <1 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 4 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 71 72 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 6 0 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 185 189 --- ---Barium ppm <1 0 --- ---Boron ppm 71 77 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06194495 (Generated: 05/30/2024 17:30:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 753512\Transmission (Auto) [VCP454999] 22 May 2024 @ 1885.0 hrs

