
VOLVO EC350E 310403 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: ML0001570
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)
Job No:

WILLIAM HAZELPO BOX 600CHANTILLY, VAUS  20153Contact: SERVICE MANAGERjimmy_elswick@wahazel.comT: (703)378-8300F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WILCHAUnique No: 11056650Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 04 Jun 2024
Report Id: WILCHA [WUSCAR] 06194527 (Generated: 06/13/2024 10:05:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service - SERVICE MANAGER ? - WILCHA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number ML0001570 --- --- ---Sample Date 23 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9621 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.006 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WILCHA [WUSCAR] 06194527 (Generated: 06/13/2024 10:05:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service - SERVICE MANAGER ? - WILCHA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 310403\Diesel Fuel [ML0001570] 23 May 2024 @ 9621.0 hrs

