
[[A69037]] VOLVO PTR240 4352107 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP304471
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: A69037

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC MAINPO BOX 4500WESTBROOK, MEUS  04098Contact: TODD PIERCEpierce@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)854-8411F: (207)854-8237
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. The oil change atthe time of sampling has been noted.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Metal levelsare typical for a new componentbreaking in. There is a high amountof fuel present in the oil. Testsconfirm the presence of fuel in theoil. The BN result indicates that thereis suitable alkalinity remaining in theoil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0006Unique No: 11057064Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 04 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 06194941 (Generated: 06/04/2024 11:57:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD PIERCE - VOLVO0006

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP304471 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 904 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 7.54 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 68 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.4 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 19.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 38 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 49 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 996 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 609 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 926 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 843 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 21 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0006 [WUSCAR] 06194941 (Generated: 06/04/2024 11:58:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD PIERCE - VOLVO0006
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO PTR240 4352107\Diesel Engine [VCP304471] 29 May 2024 @ 904.0 hrs

