
VOLVO L120H 632105 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP444335
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

OLDCASTLE LAWN AND GARDEN2427 RWS RANCH RDDAVENPORT, FLUS  33837Contact: DAVID ORTIZdavid.ortiz@oldcastle.comT: (800)833-2984F: (863)421-1776
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: GREDAVFLUnique No: 11057080Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 31 May 2024
Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06194957 (Generated: 05/31/2024 07:27:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444335 VCP429444 VCP417565 VCP409532Sample Date 24 Apr 2024 24 Jan 2024 07 Jun 2023 10 Feb 2023Machine Hours 19559 19925 18030 17307Oil Hours 0 0 500 500Oil Changed Changed N/A N/A ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.0 12.7 12.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.4 10.1 9.5 10.3Oxidation (PA) % 69 73 83 80
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.4 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 52 53 63 64Sulfation (PA) % 57 59 61 61Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 4 4 6Sodium ppm 2 3 6 3Potassium ppm 3 8 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 18 11 10Copper ppm 2 2 1 2Lead ppm <1 0 0 1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 0 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 40 43 41 36Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 2Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1552 1478 1624 1590Magnesium ppm 483 533 503 511Zinc ppm 986 1077 1030 986Phosphorus ppm 895 832 834 818Barium ppm 1 5 0 0Boron ppm 46 46 35 34

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GREDAVFL [WUSCAR] 06194957 (Generated: 05/31/2024 07:27:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVID ORTIZ - GREDAVFL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632105\Diesel Engine [VCP444335] 24 Apr 2024 @ 19559.0 hrs

