
SUBARU SUBARU WRX - GASOLINE ENGINESample No: VCP383776
Oil Type: AMSOIL (ASL) SYN MOTOR OIL 5W30

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC314 MAIN STREETCARIBOU, MEUS  04736Contact: THOMAS PICKANCEthomas.pickance@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)227-2479F: (207)498-6596
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0010Unique No: 11058301Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 05 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 06196178 (Generated: 06/05/2024 16:02:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: THOMAS PICKANCE - VOLVO0010

 SAMPLE INFORMATION
Sample Number VCP383776 VCP418880 VCP388146 ---Sample Date 21 Apr 2024 28 Feb 2024 15 Oct 2023 ---Machine Hours 73272 70384 43811 ---Oil Hours 2888 3151 5112 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITION
Visc @ 100°C cSt 10.0 9.8 8.8 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.84 10.72 7.9 ---Oxidation (PA) % 74 67 13 ---
 CONTAMINATION
Water % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.1 0.1 0 ---Nitration (PA) % 12 12 10 ---Sulfation (PA) % 35 33 12 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 12 14 16 ---Sodium ppm 6 7 4 ---Potassium ppm <1 3 6 ---
 WEAR METALS
Iron ppm 6 10 2 ---Copper ppm 4 6 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 4 4 3 ---Chromium ppm <1 1 0 ---Molybdenum ppm 205 194 65 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm 3 2 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVES
Calcium ppm 1286 1202 1148 ---Magnesium ppm 930 896 946 ---Zinc ppm 861 851 804 ---Phosphorus ppm 742 739 650 ---Barium ppm <1 0 0 ---Boron ppm 321 289 154 --- Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0010 [WUSCAR] 06196178 (Generated: 06/05/2024 16:02:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: THOMAS PICKANCE - VOLVO0010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SUBARU SUBARU SUBARU WRX\Gasoline Engine [VCP383776] 21 Apr 2024 @ 73272.0 hrs

