
[[E15324]] VOLVO L30B 1836324 - FRONT DIFFERENTIAL

Sample No: VCP383313
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: E15324

MCCAIN FOODS319 RICHARDSON RDEASTON, MEUS  04740Contact: JEFFREY SAUCIERjeffrey.saucier@mccain.comT: (207)488-1399F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Appearance ismilky. There is a high concentrationof water present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: MCCEASVCUnique No: 11059183Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Jun 2024
Report Id: MCCEASVC [WUSCAR] 06197060 (Generated: 06/04/2024 14:54:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JEFFREY SAUCIER - MCCEASVC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP383313 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5956 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 153 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.957 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 174 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 31 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 14 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 673 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 7 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MCCEASVC [WUSCAR] 06197060 (Generated: 06/04/2024 14:54:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JEFFREY SAUCIER - MCCEASVC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L30B 1836324\Front Differential [VCP383313] 01 May 2024 @ 5956.0 hrs

