
[[SWA563649]] TERRAMAC RT14R 14RH00107 - TOP SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP435739
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SWA563649

ALTA EQUIPMENT5985 COURT STREET ROADSYRACUSE, NYUS  13206Contact: JIM STRIGLEJIM.STRIGLE@ALTG.COMT: (315)437-2611F: (315)434-9471
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0142Unique No: 11059189Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06197066 (Generated: 06/04/2024 22:23:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435739 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2703 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 33.0 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 12 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 7 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 146 --- --- ---Copper ppm 920 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 7 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 84 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 18 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 5 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 363 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 521 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 11 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0142 [WUSCAR] 06197066 (Generated: 06/04/2024 22:23:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIM STRIGLE - VOLVO0142
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TERRAMAC TERRAMAC RT14R 14RH00107\Top Swing Drive [VCP435739] 24 May 2024 @ 2703.0 hrs

