
[[363]] JOHN DEERE 814432 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP397839
Oil Type: DRYDENE LIMITED SLIP GEAR 80W90
Job No: 363

TOTAL DEVELOPMENT SOLUTIONS LLC7805 PROGRESS CTGAINESVILLE, VAUS  20155Contact: JOE SEALEjseale@totaldevelopmentsolutions.comT: (703)222-0497F: (703)753-4586
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: TOTGAIUnique No: 11059194Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Jun 2024
Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06197071 (Generated: 06/05/2024 10:26:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP397839 VCP310967 --- ---Sample Date 10 May 2024 05 Apr 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 6701 1507 --- ---Oil Hours 1000 1507 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 139 189 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 300 22 --- ---Sodium ppm 6 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 17 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 731 280 --- ---Copper ppm 1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 101 6 --- ---Chromium ppm 8 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 7 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm 8 5 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 67 28 --- ---Magnesium ppm 16 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 22 23 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 349 469 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 15 86 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06197071 (Generated: 06/05/2024 10:26:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	JOHN DEERE JOHN DEERE 814432\Front Left Final Drive [VCP397839] 10 May 2024 @ 6701.0 hrs

