
VOLVO A25G 742079 - BOGIE/CENTER RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP362680
Oil Type: VOLVO API GL-5 SAE 75W90
Job No:

WELLONS CONSTRUCTION510 N POWELL AVEDUNN, NCUS  28334Contact: GREG WRENCH
T: (910)892-6630F: (910)892-3046
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: WELDUNUnique No: 11059206Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 04 Jun 2024
Report Id: WELDUN [WUSCAR] 06197083 (Generated: 06/05/2024 09:31:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GREG WRENCH - WELDUN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP362680 VCP358231 --- ---Sample Date 28 May 2024 03 Oct 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 5148 4011 --- ---Oil Hours 1100 4011 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 51.5 59.4 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 1 3 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 258 --- ---Copper ppm 7 53 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 6 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 14 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 14 25 --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 0 11 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2395 1418 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 296 196 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WELDUN [WUSCAR] 06197083 (Generated: 06/05/2024 09:31:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GREG WRENCH - WELDUN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 742079\Bogie/Center Right Final Drive [VCP362680] 28 May 2024 @ 5148.0 hrs

