
[[X59675]] SUPERIOR BROOM DT74J 823493 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP437444
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: X59675

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Saint RosePO BOX 997SAINT ROSE, LAUS  70087Contact: DANA FOSHEEdfoshee@scottcompanies.comT: (504)461-0961F: (504)461-0970
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.Metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. Lightfuel dilution occurring. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Fuel ispresent in the oil and is lowering theviscosity. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: SCOSAIUnique No: 11059535Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 05 Jun 2024
Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06197412 (Generated: 06/05/2024 10:30:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP437444 --- --- ---Sample Date 29 May 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 637 --- --- ---Oil Hours 636 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 9.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 75 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 80 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 3.1 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 --- --- ---Copper ppm 52 --- --- ---Lead ppm 12 --- --- ---Tin ppm 2 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 241 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1348 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 805 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1015 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 849 --- --- ---Barium ppm 2 --- --- ---Boron ppm 200 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSAI [WUSCAR] 06197412 (Generated: 06/05/2024 10:30:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DANA FOSHEE - SCOSAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SUPERIOR BROOM SUPERIOR BROOM DT74J 823493\Diesel Engine [VCP437444] 29 May 2024 @ 636.9 hrs

