
[[717447 RENTALS]] VOLVO EC350E 314596 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP431658
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 717447 RENTALS

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: N. FACEYnfacey@altaequipfl.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. Metal levels are typical for anew component breaking in. There isa high amount of visible silt presentin the sample. The condition of theoil is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 11070533Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06203072 (Generated: 06/10/2024 15:13:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431658 --- --- ---Sample Date 03 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 619 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 162 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 563 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 11 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 9 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 6 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 282 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06203072 (Generated: 06/10/2024 15:13:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: N. FACEY - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 314596\Front Right Final Drive [VCP431658] 03 Jun 2024 @ 619.0 hrs

