
[[SWO-072403]] VOLVO A60H 340044 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP440082
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: SWO-072403

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor. Please note thatthis is a corrected copy for data entryupdates.The copper level isabnormal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. There is a lightconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 11071132Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 19 Jun 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06203671 (Generated: 06/19/2024 11:42:55) Rev: 4 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440082 VCP362534 VCP351723 VCP335128Sample Date 31 May 2024 24 May 2022 06 May 2022 09 Feb 2022Machine Hours 9784 0 6474 5979Oil Hours 0 0 6474 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.2 42.8 42.9 41.2
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.357 NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 28 11 26 26Sodium ppm 3 5 4 5Potassium ppm 0 0 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 24 29 89 85Copper ppm 222 312 299 378Lead ppm 0 <1 1 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 2 5 4Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 7 2 2 1Nickel ppm 0 2 2 4Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 1 2 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3124 2812 3919 4118Magnesium ppm 36 17 27 20Zinc ppm 1178 1174 1583 1526Phosphorus ppm 1106 1193 1288 1348Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 126 94 125 116

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06203671 (Generated: 06/19/2024 11:42:58) Rev: 4 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340044\Wet Disc Brake [VCP440082] 31 May 2024 @ 9784.0 hrs

