
[[SWO-072403]] VOLVO A60H 340044 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP439805
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: SWO-072403

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Check for low coolant level. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof the coolant leak. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 11071176Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 12 Jun 2024
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06203715 (Generated: 06/18/2024 16:50:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP439805 VCP446728 VCP383715 VCP411751Sample Date 31 May 2024 01 Feb 2024 21 Aug 2023 04 Aug 2023Machine Hours 9784 9302 8811 8791Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.4 13.8 12.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.2 10.2 9.5 10.4Oxidation (PA) % 78 74 55 79
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.2 0.2 1Nitration (PA) % 56 44 43 63Sulfation (PA) % 61 59 50 64Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 13 30 10 87Sodium ppm 251 30 <1 0Potassium ppm 197 23 <1 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 4 8 58Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 3Lead ppm 2 0 <1 5Tin ppm <1 0 <1 2Aluminum ppm 3 2 5 47Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 50 43 53 39Nickel ppm 2 0 <1 2Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 2Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1740 1528 1120 1644Magnesium ppm 570 493 763 465Zinc ppm 1190 1036 1106 1029Phosphorus ppm 1046 816 963 874Barium ppm 0 5 0 2Boron ppm 62 63 12 33

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06203715 (Generated: 06/18/2024 16:50:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A60H 340044\Diesel Engine [VCP439805] 31 May 2024 @ 9784.0 hrs

