
[[SWA559244-10]] VOLVO EC220E 314027 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP416990
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SWA559244-10

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is a moderate amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 11071980Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 12 Jun 2024
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 06204519 (Generated: 06/12/2024 16:44:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416990 VCP407391 VCP323024 VCP303776Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 27 Apr 2023 21 Sep 2021 15 Apr 2021Machine Hours 8200 6997 4100 3159Oil Hours 4000 0 2000 3000Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.8 38.6 42.3 43.4Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.21 0.30 0.616 0.473
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 54728 77406 6487 ---Particles >6µm 8796 982 1209 ---Particles >14µm 770 50 95 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/20/17 23/17/13 20/17/14 ---Silicon ppm 11 10 6 5Sodium ppm 8 6 2 3Potassium ppm 6 3 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 10 6 5Copper ppm 25 27 30 26Lead ppm 0 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 4 3 6 1Chromium ppm 19 28 3 3Molybdenum ppm 9 5 0 0Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 746 582 86 90Magnesium ppm 81 40 1 2Zinc ppm 479 390 469 504Phosphorus ppm 413 345 375 431Barium ppm 1 0 0 0Boron ppm 21 9 0 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 06204519 (Generated: 06/12/2024 16:45:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 314027\Hydraulic System [VCP416990] 05 Jun 2024 @ 8200.0 hrs

