
[[X48143]] KOBELCO SK350LC-10 605072 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP454677
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: X48143

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Lavergne1231 BRIDGESTONE PARKWAYLAVERGNE, TNUS  37086Contact: CLAY COULTERCCOULTER@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: (615)793-3888F: (615)793-9655
Diagnosis
Check seals and/or filters for pointsof contaminant entry. The airbreather requires service.  If unrated,we recommend that you replace witha suitable micron rated and/ordesiccant air breather.  If rated, werecommend that you service/replacethe breather. We recommend youservice the filters on this component.Resample in 30-45 days to monitorthis situation.All component wearrates are normal. There is a highamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The oil is still serviceable providedthat the contaminant(s) can bereduced to acceptable levels.

Depot: VOLVO0129Unique No: 11071982Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 12 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06204521 (Generated: 06/12/2024 00:13:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CLAY COULTER - VOLVO0129

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454677 VCP450953 VCP371278 VCP371156Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 17 May 2024 18 Jan 2023 04 Jan 2023Machine Hours 4387 4381 0 3657Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Not Changd N/A Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 50.0 42.5 45.3 44.7Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.37 0.38 0.32 0.33
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG 0.309 NEGParticles >4µm 85258 115536 1546 67683Particles >6µm 7668 21659 842 21972Particles >14µm 113 122 143 1562ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/20/14 24/22/14 18/17/14 23/22/18Silicon ppm 2 3 0 1Sodium ppm 2 <1 0 0Potassium ppm 3 0 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 9 2 6Copper ppm 2 4 2 6Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 0 <1Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 3 0 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 65 70 33 26Magnesium ppm 3 0 9 6Zinc ppm 434 358 278 266Phosphorus ppm 348 322 259 278Barium ppm <1 0 0 1Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0129 [WUSCAR] 06204521 (Generated: 06/12/2024 00:13:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CLAY COULTER - VOLVO0129
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOBELCO KOBELCO SK350LC-10 605072\Hydraulic System [VCP454677] 05 Jun 2024 @ 4387.0 hrs

