
[UPAP-PHOENIX [1034614]] 330144 VOLVO L90G 617701 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP442984
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 1034614

U-PULL-AND-PAY LLC - PHOENIX2501 WEST BUCKEYE RDPHOENIX, AZUS  85009Contact: CASEY MILLERcasey.miller@upullandpay.comT: F: (602)233-3971
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: UPAPPHOUnique No: 11072510Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 12 Jun 2024
Report Id: UPAPPHO [WUSCAR] 06205049 (Generated: 06/12/2024 12:56:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CASEY MILLER - UPAPPHO

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442984 VCE196222 DJJ0005956 DJJ0005935Sample Date 03 Jun 2024 21 Dec 2023 10 May 2023 21 Jun 2022Machine Hours 11885 11269 10493 9277Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 46.6 45.8 45.9 40.8
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 11 13 13 8Sodium ppm 0 4 6 8Potassium ppm 1 1 2 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 20 15 20Copper ppm <1 0 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 0 <1 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 2Manganese ppm 0 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3723 3903 3814 3861Magnesium ppm 18 14 13 15Zinc ppm 1571 1599 1558 1509Phosphorus ppm 1336 1229 1204 1251Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 154 134 126 136

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: UPAPPHO [WUSCAR] 06205049 (Generated: 06/12/2024 12:56:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CASEY MILLER - UPAPPHO
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 330144 VOLVO L90G 617701\Front Axle [VCP442984] 03 Jun 2024 @ 11885.0 hrs

