
[[136477]] VOLVO EC750E 314194 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP447661
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: 136477

LATTIMORE MATERIALS/HOLCIM - ROSSER - LAFARGE14242 S SH-34SCURRY, TXUS  75158Contact: WALLACE WARRENwallace.warren@lafargeholcim.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: LATSCUUnique No: 11072532Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Jun 2024
Report Id: LATSCU [WUSCAR] 06205071 (Generated: 06/12/2024 19:25:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WALLACE WARREN - LATSCU

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP447661 VCP443077 VCP434637 VCP433908Sample Date 04 Jun 2024 19 Mar 2024 29 Dec 2023 02 Oct 2023Machine Hours 3975 3477 2941 2442Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 132 132 129 128
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 0.161 0.138 NEGSilicon ppm 48 716 530 130Sodium ppm 0 <1 4 1Potassium ppm 2 22 17 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1503 1600 1133 604Copper ppm 4 4 2 1Lead ppm 0 1 <1 0Tin ppm 0 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 5 105 89 22Chromium ppm 4 11 8 4Molybdenum ppm 9 14 0 0Nickel ppm 1 4 2 <1Titanium ppm <1 7 6 1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm 8 13 10 5Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 37 230 119 50Magnesium ppm 19 66 12 6Zinc ppm 73 95 30 24Phosphorus ppm 786 1000 985 977Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 19 195 140 165

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LATSCU [WUSCAR] 06205071 (Generated: 06/12/2024 19:25:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: WALLACE WARREN - LATSCU
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC750E 314194\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP447661] 04 Jun 2024 @ 3975.0 hrs

