
[[SWA567673 PLAINFIELD]] NEW HOLLAND SR250 NNM414760 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP444399
Oil Type: No.2 DIESEL FUEL (ULTRALOW SULPHUR)
Job No: SWA567673 PLAINFIELD

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT613 E STEVENSON RDOTTAWA, ILUS  61350Contact: CHRIS CHERVENYchris.cherveny@altg.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO5055Unique No: 11072719Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 06205258 (Generated: 06/13/2024 15:46:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS CHERVENY - VOLVO5055

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP444399 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 623 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 0 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.54 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.002 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5055 [WUSCAR] 06205258 (Generated: 06/13/2024 15:46:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS CHERVENY - VOLVO5055
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NEW HOLLAND NEW HOLLAND SR250 NNM414760\Diesel Fuel [VCP444399] 05 Jun 2024 @ 623.0 hrs

