
[[230736 ASG]] VOLVO A40D 70062 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP409583
Oil Type: {unknown}
Job No: 230736 ASG

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: ROB HOLCOMBrholcomb@romco.comT: (817)798-9289F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain thefluid from the component if this hasnot already been done. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. High wear metal levelsreflect the reported failure. There isno indication of any contamination inthe fluid. The fluid is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 11073277Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 13 Jun 2024
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06205816 (Generated: 06/14/2024 04:03:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB HOLCOMB - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409583 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 31333 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 30.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 162 --- --- ---Copper ppm 253 --- --- ---Lead ppm 13 --- --- ---Tin ppm 6 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 13 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 161 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 153 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 193 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 31 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06205816 (Generated: 06/14/2024 04:03:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ROB HOLCOMB - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40D 70062\Transmission [VCP409583] 05 Jun 2024 @ 31333.0 hrs

