
[[717425]] 5378 VOLVO L180H 5378 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP454765
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 717425

TRADEMARK METALS RECYCLING - EVERGLADES3440 NW 135TH STOPA LOCKA, FLUS  33054Contact: RYAN BOWDEN
T: F: (305)681-4914
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. In theabsence of other significant wearmetals, suspect copper due tosources other than wear (i.e. coolingcore). All other component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: TRAOPAUnique No: 11073551Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 13 Jun 2024
Report Id: TRAOPA [WUSCAR] 06206090 (Generated: 06/13/2024 14:03:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOPA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP454765 DJJ022718 VCP433340 VCP312211Sample Date 05 Jun 2024 05 Apr 2024 22 Nov 2023 03 May 2021Machine Hours 8050 7610 6747 626Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 13.5 13.3 11.2Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 8.2 8.1 ---Oxidation (PA) % 56 61 61 96
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 52 62 63 63Sulfation (PA) % 52 53 53 70Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 0.2 39.1Silicon ppm 4 2 3 21Sodium ppm 2 0 2 3Potassium ppm 2 <1 2 6
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 4 7 21Copper ppm 30 2 3 391Lead ppm <1 <1 0 1Tin ppm <1 0 0 3Aluminum ppm 3 <1 2 1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 73 58 62 41Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 0 4Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1236 1095 1073 1568Magnesium ppm 1165 1008 993 450Zinc ppm 1443 1293 1282 1124Phosphorus ppm 1153 1050 1012 949Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRAOPA [WUSCAR] 06206090 (Generated: 06/13/2024 14:03:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RYAN BOWDEN - TRAOPA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO 5378 VOLVO L180H 5378\Diesel Engine [VCP454765] 05 Jun 2024 @ 8050.0 hrs

