
KOMATSU WA500-8 WP7225 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP443413
Oil Type: KOMATSU 15W40
Job No:

LEGACY MATERIALS5740 UTE CTVAN METER, IAUS  50038Contact: ALEXqc@legacymaterials.orgT: (641)840-1326F: 
Diagnosis
Check for low coolant level. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. Sodiumand/or potassium levels are high. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: LEGVANUnique No: 11074842Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Jun 2024
Report Id: LEGVAN [WUSCAR] 06207381 (Generated: 06/15/2024 11:49:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX ? - LEGVAN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443413 --- --- ---Sample Date 04 Jun 2024 --- --- ---Machine Hours 9426 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.9 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.1 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 67 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 72 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 33 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 48 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 15 --- --- ---Copper ppm 13 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 68 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2002 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 505 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1386 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1182 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 35 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEGVAN [WUSCAR] 06207381 (Generated: 06/15/2024 11:49:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALEX ? - LEGVAN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	KOMATSU KOMATSU WA500-8 WP7225\Diesel Engine [VCP443413] 04 Jun 2024 @ 9426.0 hrs

